
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 15-0401

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools

TIME & (January 1, 2016 through December 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 19, 2016
  

GROUP NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP 1. BAR, ALIGNING PRY:
15 ea. PRICE 9.81 12.04 19.14 8.76 14.918
SIZE 1/2" X 16" (9379) TOTAL 147.15 180.60 287.10 131.40 223.77 NO BID

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto J2116 Armstrong 70-501 Armstrong 70-503 Select 73086837 Proto 2150256
10 ea. PRICE 13.48 21.59 24.72 15.15 18.48
SIZE 5/8" X 18" ROLLING HEAD (9382) TOTAL 134.80 215.90 247.20 151.50 184.80 NO BID

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto J2120 Armstrong 70-521 Armstrong 70-521 Armstrong 01960426 Armostrong 0242389
10 ea. PRICE 18.39 22.29 25.52 18.09 27.67
SIZE 3/4" X 24" (9378) TOTAL 183.90 222.90 255.20 180.90 276.68 NO BID

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto J2124 Armstrong 70-505 Armstrong 70-505 Proto 84965425 Proto 2150258
  

  *
 TOTAL FOR GROUP 1 TOTAL 465.85 619.40 789.50 463.80 685.25
GROUP 2 BLADE:

10 ea. PRICE 1.46 2.22
CUTTING, SIZE 6, TPI 7, WOOD (9663) TOTAL 14.60 22.20 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW4802 Lenox 20560
40 ea. PRICE 1.29 4.08
CUTTING, SIZE 6, TPI 10, FINE WOOD (9664) TOTAL 51.60 163.20 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW4806 Dewalt DW4806
5 ea. PRICE 0.89 1.39
CUTTING, SIZE 4-1/8", TPI 6, WOOD (9665) TOTAL 4.45 6.95 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW3750H Lenox BT486J
20 ea. PRICE 3.07 3.71
HACKSAW, SIZE 9, TPI 10, (9670) TOTAL 61.40 74.20 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Lenox 960R Lenox 20597
15 ea. PRICE 1.67 1.04
HACKSAW, SIZE 12, TPI 14, (9669) TOTAL 25.05 15.60 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DWHT20551 Cooper 62706
10 ea. PRICE 1.03 1.04
HACKSAW, SIZE 12, TPI 24, (9666) TOTAL 10.30 10.40 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Stanley 15-824A Cooper 62749
1,000 ea. PRICE 1.14 1.04
HACKSAW, SIZE 12, TPI 32, (9668) TOTAL 1,140.00 1,040.00 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Stanley 15-630 Cooper 62776
10 ea. PRICE 1.48 2.03
JIGSAW, SIZE 4, TPI 10 (9671) TOTAL 14.80 20.30 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

8. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW3710-5 Cooper 62839
100 ea. PRICE 5.92 8.91
BLADE PVC PIPE SAW 18INTPI 11, LENOX HSB18 (9672) TOTAL 592.00 891.00 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID INCOMPLETE NO BID

9. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Lenox 20981-H5B18 Lenox 20981

  *
 TOTAL GROUP 2 TOTAL 1,914.20 2,243.85
GROUP 3 DRILL BIT, HIGH SPEED:

25 ea. PRICE 0.69 0.93 0.818
SIZE 1/16" (11461) TOTAL 17.25 23.25 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 20.45 NO BID

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1104 Precision 010004 FMT 53005
35 ea. PRICE 0.82 0.95 0.870
SIZE 1/8" (11464) TOTAL 28.70 33.25 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 30.45 NO BID

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1108 Precision 010008 FMT 53009
50 ea. PRICE 1.54 1.80 1.913
SIZE 1/4" (11463) TOTAL 77.00 90.00 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 95.65 NO BID

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1116 Precision 010016 FMT 53017
15 ea. PRICE 6.93 7.01 7.260
SIZE 1/2" (11462) TOTAL 103.95 105.15 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 108.90 NO BID

4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1132 Precision 010032 FMT 53033
15 ea. PRICE 1.15 1.29 1.298
SIZE 3/16" (11472) TOTAL 17.25 19.35 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 19.47 NO BID

5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1112 Precision 010012 FMT 53013
10 ea. PRICE 0.76 0.93 0.833
SIZE 3/32" (11474) TOTAL 7.60 9.30 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 8.33 NO BID

6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1106 Precision 010006 FMT 53007
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 15-0401

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools

TIME & (January 1, 2016 through December 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 19, 2016
  

GROUP NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY B
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30 ea. PRICE 3.62 4.10 4.313
SIZE 3/8" (11475) TOTAL 108.60 123.00 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 129.39 NO BID

7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1124 Precision 010024 FMT 53025
20 ea. PRICE 2.56 0.78 2.963
SIZE 5/16" (11476) TOTAL 51.20 15.60 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 59.26 NO BID

8. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1120 Precision 010020 FMT 53021
20 ea. PRICE 0.91 0.63 1.035
SIZE 5/32" (11477) TOTAL 18.20 12.60 NO BID NOT BIDDING PER 20.70 NO BID

9. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1110 Precision 010010 QUANTITY FMT 53011
10 ea. PRICE 5.41 5.61 5.985
SIZE 7/16" (11478) TOTAL 54.10 56.10 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 59.85 NO BID

10. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1128 Precision 010028 FMT 53029
 10 ea. UNIT 1.43 1.58 1.298

SIZE 7/32" (11479) PRICE 14.30 15.80 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 12.98 NO BID
11. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Dewalt DW1114 Precision 010014 FMT 53013

10 ea. UNIT 1.53 0.98 0.863
SIZE 7/64" (11480) PRICE 15.30 9.80 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 8.63 NO BID

12. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Dewalt DW1107 Precision 010007 FMT 53008
20 ea. UNIT 2.34 2.26 2.775
SIZE 9/32" (11481) PRICE 46.80 45.20 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 55.50 NO BID

13. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Dewalt DW1118 Precision 010018 FMT 53019
10 ea. UNIT 0.90 1.05 1.133
SIZE 9/64" (11482) PRICE 9.00 10.50 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 11.33 NO BID

14. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Dewalt DW1109 Precision 010009 FMT 53010
10 ea. UNIT 3.11 3.59 3.938
SIZE 11/32" (11465) PRICE 31.10 35.90 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 39.38 NO BID

15. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Dewalt DW1122 Precision 010022 FMT 53023
10 ea. UNIT 0.98 1.18 1.133
SIZE 11/64" (11466) PRICE 9.80 11.80 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 11.33 NO BID

16. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Dewalt DW1111 Precision 010011 FMT 53012
10 ea. UNIT 4.51 4.86 5.100
SIZE 13/32" (11467) PRICE 45.10 48.60 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 51.00 NO BID

17. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Dewalt DW1126 Precision 010026 FMT 53027
10 ea. UNIT 1.38 1.43 1.485
SIZE 13/64" (11468) PRICE 13.80 14.30 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 14.85 NO BID

18. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Dewalt DW1113 Precision 010013 FMT  53014
10 ea. UNIT 6.03 6.61 6.653
SIZE 15/32" (11469) PRICE 60.30 66.10 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 66.53 NO BID

19. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Dewalt DW1130 Precision 010030 FMT 53031
10 ea. PRICE 1.63 1.73 1.800
SIZE 15/64" (11470) TOTAL 16.30 17.30 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 18.00 NO BID

20. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1115 Precision 0410015 FMT 53016
10 ea. PRICE 2.15 2.20 2.438
SIZE 17/64" (11471) TOTAL 21.50 22.00 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 24.38 NO BID

21. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1117 Precision 010017 FMT 53018

  *
 TOTAL GROUP 3 TOTAL 767.15 784.90 866.36
GROUP 4 DRILL BIT, GENERAL PURPOSE:

10 ea. PRICE 0.69 0.43 0.818
SIZE 1/16" (11454) TOTAL 6.90 4.30 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 8.18 INCOMPLETE

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1104 Drill America D/AN 1/16 FMT 53005
10 ea. PRICE 5.41 3.08 5.985
SIZE 7/16" (11502) TOTAL 54.10 30.80 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 59.85 INCOMPLETE

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1128 Drill America D/AN 7/16 FMT 53029
10 ea. PRICE 12.76 5.30 21.473
SIZE 9/16" X 1/2" SHANK (11458) TOTAL 127.60 53.00 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 214.73 INCOMPLETE

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1620 Drill America D/ARSD 9/16 FMT 0316238
5 ea. PRICE 14.79 5.81 23.220
SIZE 5/8" X 1/2" SHANK (11456) TOTAL 73.95 29.05 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 116.10 INCOMPLETE

4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1622 Drill America D/ARSD 5/8 FMT 0316242
10 ea. PRICE 17.44 12.52 28.043
SIZE 3/4" (11455) TOTAL 174.40 125.20 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 280.43 INCOMPLETE

5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1625 Drill America D/ARSD 3/4 FMT 0316250

2



F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 15-0401

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools
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10 ea. PRICE 21.60 15.16 34.598
SIZE 7/8" (11457) TOTAL 216.00 151.60 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 345.98 INCOMPLETE

6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1627 Drill America D/ARSD 7/8 FMT 0316258
10 ea. PRICE 28.31 19.64 44.933
SIZE 1" (11459) TOTAL 283.10 196.40 NO BID CONDITIONAL BID 449.33 INCOMPLETE

7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW1629 Drill America D/ARSD1 FMT 0316266

  *
 TOTAL GROUP 4 TOTAL 936.05 590.35 1,474.60
GROUP 5 DRILL BIT, MASONRY:

15 ea. PRICE 1.75 0.74 NO BID 0.92 3.615
SIZE 1/4" (11488) TOTAL 26.25 11.10 13.80 54.23 INCOMPLETE

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5225 Drill America DAM 4 x 1/4 USA 71250161 Rock River 0259441
15 ea. PRICE 2.51 1.30 1.31 5.13
SIZE 3/8" (11490) TOTAL 37.65 19.50 NO BID 19.65 76.95 INCOMPLETE

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5230 Drill America DAM 4 x 3/8 USA 71250245 Rock River 0259444
10 ea. PRICE 2.09 0.97 1.35 5.13
SIZE 5/16" (11491) TOTAL 20.90 9.70 NO BID 13.50 51.30 INCOMPLETE

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5228 Drill America DAM 4x5/16 USA 71250203 Rock River 0259443
5 ea. PRICE 2.76 1.91 1.88 6.863
SIZE 7/16" (11492) TOTAL 13.80 9.55 NO BID 9.40 34.32 INCOMPLETE

4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5234 Drill America DAM 4x7/16 USA 71250294 Rock River 0259445
5 ea. PRICE 4.41 2.56 2.60 16.373
SIZE 9/16" (11494) TOTAL 22.05 12.80 NO BID 13.00 81.87 INCOMPLETE

5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5217 Drill America DAM 6x9/16x3/8 USA 71250369 Rock River 0234892

5 ea. PRICE 6.14 6.96 6.30 24.72
SIZE 3/4" (11489) TOTAL 30.70 34.80 NO BID 31.50 123.60 INCOMPLETE

6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5244 Drill America DAM 6x3/4 USA 71250484 Rock River 0259419
5 ea. PRICE 19.49 7.47 7.60 31.695
SIZE 7/8" (11493) TOTAL 97.45 37.35 NO BID 38.00 158.48 INCOMPLETE

7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5219 Drill America DAM 6x7/8 USA 71250567 Rock River 0259420
10 ea. PRICE 1.46 0.67 2.18 3.128
SIZE 3/16" X 4", (11496) TOTAL 14.60 6.70 NO BID 21.80 31.28 INCOMPLETE

8. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5223 Drill America DAM 4x3/16 V American 71218127 Rock River 0259440
5 ea. PRICE 6.88 3.41 3.47 14.153
SIZE 5/8" X 8", W/ 3/8" SHANK (11487) TOTAL 34.40 17.05 NO BID 17.35 70.77 INCOMPLETE

9. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5242 Drill America DAM 6X5/8X3/8 USA 71250401 Rock River 0259414
5 ea. PRICE 10.29 6.54 6.64 15.87
SIZE 5/8" X 12", (11485) TOTAL 51.45 32.70 NO BID 33.20 79.35 INCOMPLETE

10. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Milwaukee 48-20-8841 Drill America DAM 13x5/8x1/2 USA 71251409 Rock River 0259415
5 ea. PRICE 5.48 4.96 6.97 14.153
SIZE 1/2" X 12", (11484) TOTAL 27.40 24.80 NO BID 34.85 70.77 INCOMPLETE

11. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5236 Drill America DAM 13x1/2x3/8 USA 71251326 Rock River 0259412
5 ea. PRICE 11.19 7.80 7.50 21.563
SIZE 1/2" X 16", W/ 3/8" SHANK (11498) TOTAL 55.95 39.00 NO BID 37.50 107.82 INCOMPLETE

12. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Milwaukee 48-20-8832 Drill America DAM 18x1/2x3/8 USA 71252324 Rock River 0259413
5 ea. PRICE 9.58 9.80 11.25 26.01
SIZE 3/4" X 13", (11483) CARBIDE TIP TOTAL 47.90 49.00 NO BID 56.25 130.05 INCOMPLETE

13. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5245 Drill America DAM 13x3/4 USA 71251482 Rock River 0259417
5 ea. PRICE 18.11 15.77 13.56 33.195
SIZE 1" X 10", W/ 1/2" SHANK (11486) TOTAL 90.55 78.85 NO BID 67.80 165.98 INCOMPLETE

14. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Milwaukee 48-20-8854 Drill America DAM 13x1 USA 71251649 Rock River 0259422
5 ea. PRICE 14.78 15.77 13.56 56.13
SIZE 1" X 12", (11495) TOTAL 73.90 78.85 NO BID 67.80 280.65 INCOMPLETE

15. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5249 Drill America DAM 13x1 USA 71252647 Rock River 0259432
 
  *
TOTAL GROUP 5 TOTAL 644.95 461.75 475.40 1,517.38

GROUP 6 DRILL BIT HAMMER, MASONRY:
5 ea. PRICE 14.53 14.22 11.80 30.908
SIZE 3/8" X 11" SPLINE (11506) TOTAL 72.65 71.10 NO BID 59.00 154.54 INCOMPLETE

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5700 Dewalt DW5700 Milwaukee 97570766 Dewalt 0234911
10 ea. PRICE 6.60 6.39 6.25 11.798
SIZE 3/8" X 12" SDS (11503) TOTAL 66.00 63.90 NO BID 62.50 117.98 INCOMPLETE

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewal t DW5430 Dewalt DW5430 Milwaukee 05092945 Rock River 0259407

3
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 5 ea. PRICE 13.53 17.47 11.95 21.51
SIZE 3/8" X 20" SDS (11504) TOTAL 67.65 87.35 NO BID 59.75 107.55 INCOMPLETE

3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5432 Dewalt DW5432 5-B Power 00197467 Rock River 0259408
10 ea. PRICE 8.03 14.69 8.45 14.153
SIZE 1/2" X 12" (11497) TOTAL 80.30 146.90 NO BID 84.50 141.53 INCOMPLETE

4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5439 Dewalt DW5703 5-B Power 00197541 Rock River 0259412
20 ea. PRICE 17.50 18.72 15.56 39.233
SIZE 1/2" X 16" SPLINE (11505) TOTAL 350.00 374.40 NO BID 311.20 784.66 INCOMPLETE

5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5704 Dewalt DW5704 Milwaukee 01708619 Dewalt 0234935
3 ea. PRICE 22.75 22.48 21.56 51.488
SIZE 1/2" X 23" SPLINE (11507) TOTAL 68.25 67.44 NO BID 64.68 154.46 INCOMPLETE

6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5705 Dewalt DW5705 Dewalt DW5705 Dewalt 0234936
10 ea. PRICE 53.44 72.38 63.56 144.54
SIZE 1 1/2" X 23" SPLINE (11508) TOTAL 534.40 723.80 NO BID 635.60 1,445.40 INCOMPLETE

7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Dewalt DW5732 Dewalt DW5732 Milwaukee 06316723 Dewalt 0234959
 
 *
TOTAL GROUP 6 TOTAL 1,239.25 1,534.89 1,277.23 2,906.12

GROUP 7 FILES:
10 ea. UNIT 2.43 4.80 5.11 9.188
SIZE 6", BASTARD FLAT (11887) PRICE 24.30 48.00 51.10 CONDITIONAL BID 91.88 INCOMPLETE

1. NICHOLSON 3467 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL Stanley 22-170 Nicholson 03467 Nicholson 03467N Nicholson 0817763
15 ea. UNIT 2.84 5.99 6.36 11.46
SIZE 8", BASTARD FLAT (11888) PRICE 42.60 89.85 95.40 CONDITIONAL BID 171.90 INCOMPLETE

2. NICHOLSON 3566 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL Stanley 22-171 Nicholson 03566 Nicholson 03566N Nicholson 0817764
15 ea. UNIT 3.57 7.63 7.86 12.758
SIZE 10", BASTARD FLAT (11885) PRICE 53.55 114.45 117.90 CONDITIONAL BID 191.37 INCOMPLETE

3. NICHOLSON 3665 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL Stanley 22-172 Nicholson 03665 Nicholson 03665N Nicholson 0817765
15 ea. UNIT 4.71 10.46 10.78 17.64
SIZE 12", BASTARD FLAT (11886) PRICE 70.65 156.90 161.70 CONDITIONAL BID 264.60 INCOMPLETE

4. NICHOLSON 3764 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL Stanely 22-173 Nicholson 03764 Nicholson 03764N Nicholson 0817766
20 ea. UNIT 11.09 14.42 14.88 26.858
SIZE 14", BASTARD FLAT (11889) PRICE 221.80 288.40 297.60 CONDITIONAL BID 537.16 INCOMPLETE

5. NICHOLSON 3863 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL Nicholson 03863N Nicholson 03863 Nicholson 03863N Nicholson 0817767
15 ea. UNIT 2.28 4.68 4.83 5.963

NICHOLSON 11781 OR APPROVED EQUAL PRICE 34.20 70.20 72.45 CONDITIONAL BID 89.45 INCOMPLETE
6. SIZE 6", BASTARD ROUND, RAT TAIL (11892) TOTAL Stanely 22-307 Nicholson 11781 Nicholson 11781N Nicholson 0804694

10 ea. UNIT 3.16 5.87 6.06 10.643
SIZE 10", BASTARD ROUND (11890) PRICE 31.60 58.70 60.60 CONDITIONAL BID 106.43 INCOMPLETE

7. NICHOLSON 12019 OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL Stanley 22-178 Nicholson 12019 Nicholson 12019N Nicholson 0817819
40 ea. UNIT 22.08 19.46 20.07 39.705
SIZE 14", RASP HORSE FILE, (15086) PRICE 883.20 778.40 802.80 CONDITIONAL BID 1,588.20 INCOMPLETE

8. NICHOLSON 18057N OR APPROVED EQUAL TOTAL Nicholson 18057N Nicholson 18057N Nicholson 18057N Nicholson 0809339
 
 *
TOTAL GROUP 7 TOTAL 1,361.90 1,604.90 1,659.55 3,040.99

GROUP 8 CHISELS:
15 ea. UNIT 4.24 2.45 4.27 2.26 4.493 4.45
SIZE 1/2", COLD (10343) PRICE 63.60 36.75 64.05 33.90 67.40 66.75

1. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Proto J86A7/16 Stanley 16-287 Gearwrench 82264 Stanley 16-287 Rock River 2115873 NAPA 925A
25 ea. UNIT 8.91 3.05 6.92 2.82 5.243 6.88
SIZE 3/4", COLD (10344) PRICE 222.75 76.25 173.00 70.50 131.08 172.00

2. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Proto J86A3/4X8 Stanley 16-289 Gearwrench 82266 Stanley 16-289 Rock River 2115874 NAPA 927
35 ea. UNIT 9.58 3.80 9.62 3.59 9.105 8.49
SIZE 1" X 7 1/2", COLD (10342) PRICE 335.30 133.00 336.70 125.65 318.68 297.15

3. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Proto J86A7/8x8 Stanley 16-290 Gearwrench 82268 Stanley 16-290 Gearwrench 0224625 NAPA 929
10 ea. UNIT 9.48 10.75 15.21 9.99 10.20 12.98
SIZE 1-1/2", WOOD (10346) PRICE 94.80 107.50 152.10 99.90 102.00 129.80

4. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Stanley 16-980 Stanley 16-980 Armstrong 70-319 Armstrong 70-319 Proto 16-324 Armstrong 70-319
 
 *
TOTAL GROUP 8 TOTAL 716.45 353.50 725.85 329.95 619.15 665.70

GROUP 9 SAW:
50 ea. UNIT 16.75 16.20 19.95 14.92 26.993 27.99
SAW PVC W/BLADE 18IN HSF180, LENOX 20980 (15586) PRICE 837.50 810.00 997.50 746.00 1,349.65 1,399.50

1. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Lenox HSF18 Lenox 20980 Lenox 20980 Lenox 64030596 Lenox 57014 Milwaukee 48-22-0223
20 ea. UNIT 5.41 5.28 11.17 9.61 6.510 19.99
SAW HAND 8 POINT 26 IN, STANLEY 15-526 (15587) PRICE 108.20 105.60 223.40 192.20 130.20 399.80

2. Manufacturer/Model TOTAL Stanley 15-726 Stanley 15-726 Nicholson NS1501 Nicholson 07070519 Stanley 15-726 Stanley 15-726
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 *
TOTAL GROUP 9 TOTAL 945.70 915.60 1,220.90 938.20 1,479.85 1,799.30

GROUP 10 MISCELLANEOUS TOOLS:
15 ea. PRICE 64.17 47.85 58.23
SIZE 20" X 8-1/2" X 9-1/2", TOOL BOX (16850) TOTAL 962.55 INCOMPLETE 717.75 INCOMPLETE NO BID 873.45

1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Klein Tools 54401 Armstrong 16-605 NAPA BK01022001
5 sets PRICE 61.90 80.78 81.17
HOLESAW, 1/4" ARBOR ADPT METAL (15890) JOURNEYMANS SET TOTAL 309.50 INCOMPLETE 403.90 INCOMPLETE NO BID 405.85

2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Milwaukee 49-22-4025 Dewalt D180001 Irwin 3073004
5 sets PRICE 13.69 14.26 16.99
RULE FOLDING 6FT (15502) TOTAL 68.45 INCOMPLETE 71.30 INCOMPLETE NO BID 84.95

3. LUFKIN 1066D OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL Lufkin 10660MN Lufkin 1066D Lufkin 1066DN
5 sets PRICE 12.71 13.85 15.99
TAPE STEEL CIRCULAR 1/4 X6FT (16525) TOTAL 63.55 INCOMPLETE 69.25 INCOMPLETE NO BID 79.95

4. LUFKIN W606PD OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL Lufkin W606PM Lufkin W606PD Lufkin W606PD
5 sets PRICE 99.79 84.18 89.99
TAPE MEASURE NON-METAL 100 FT (16515) TOTAL 498.95 INCOMPLETE 420.90 INCOMPLETE NO BID 449.95

5. LUFKIN HD406 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL Lufkin HD406 Lufkin HD406 Lufkin HD406N
20 ea. PRICE 12.53 6.59 9.99
SIZE 26", SAW, STANDARD CABLE (15602) TOTAL 250.60 INCOMPLETE 131.80 INCOMPLETE NO BID 199.80

6. MCMASTER CARR 39705A31 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL McMaster Carr 39705A31 SHI R014EG McMaster Carr 39705A31
30 ea. PRICE 13.65 5.67 10.99
SIZE 46", SAW, STANDARD CABLE (15603) TOTAL 409.50 INCOMPLETE 170.10 INCOMPLETE NO BID 329.70

7. MCMASTER CARR 39705A32 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL McMaster Carr 39705A32 SHI 322932 McMaster Carr 39705A32
20 ea. PRICE 68.80 58.72 69.99
MEASURING WHEEL, TAPE, (16512) TOTAL 1,376.00 INCOMPLETE 1,174.40 INCOMPLETE NO BID 1,399.80

8. SIZE 0 – 9999 FEET LUFKIN MW38 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL Lufkin MW38M Lufkin MW38 Wfkin MW38M
70 sets PRICE 28.54 25.17 69.99
PUMP UTILITY 1 1/2 DIS 13 GPM, (15067) TOTAL 1,997.80 INCOMPLETE 1,761.90 INCOMPLETE NO BID 4,899.30

9. BECKSON 136PF6 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL Beckson 136PF6 Beckson 136PF6 Beckson 136PF6
75 ea. PRICE 6.26 6.10 16.99
TAPE MEASURE OD 38IN X 10FT (16509) TOTAL 469.50 INCOMPLETE 457.50 INCOMPLETE NO BID 1,274.25

10. JIM-GEM 39480 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL Jim-Gen 39480 Lufkin W6110 Jim-Gem 39480
15 ea. PRICE 67.65 63.58 149.95
SETTER VALVE 4-12IN, (33730) TOTAL 1,014.75 INCOMPLETE 953.70 INCOMPLETE NO BID 2,249.25

11. RAPTOR 41038 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL Raptor 41038 Raptor 41038 Raptor 41038
50 ea. PRICE 16.00 24.44 13.99
GUN GREASE LEVERTYPE, (13021) TOTAL 800.00 INCOMPLETE 1,222.00 INCOMPLETE NO BID 699.50

12. LINCOLN 1142 OR APPROVED EQUAL MFG/MODEL Lincoln 1142 Lincoln 1142 NAPA 715-1241 
 
 
TOTAL GROUP 10 TOTAL 8,221.15 7,554.50 12,945.75

GROUP 11 PROTO PRICE LIST (ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE $45,000)
 LIST PRICE 16.16 16.16 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

1. Chisel Cold 3/4 IN Proto 86A-5/8, SAWS #10344 DISCOUNT 6.08 7.11
 
 LIST PRICE 73.80 73.80 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

2. Handle HNGE 18-5/8 x 1/2 IN DR Proto 5468, SAWS #13045 DISCOUNT 29.04 32.47
 
 LIST PRICE 135.54 135.54 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

3. Punch Drift Set 7 Piece Proto 96A, SAWS #15072 DISCOUNT 50.64 59.64
 
 LIST PRICE 85.85 85.85 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

4. Ratchet Drive 1/2 IN Proto 5449, SAWS #15089 DISCOUNT 33.64 37.77
 
 LIST PRICE 127.33 127.33 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

5. Screw/DR set Combo 8 Piece Proto 88808, SAWS #15728 DISCOUNT 44.39 56.03

5



F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 15-0401

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Non-Electrical Hand Tools

TIME & (January 1, 2016 through December 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 19, 2016
  

GROUP NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY B
u
ll

ch
as

e,
 I

n
c.

1
4
2

0
 C

y
p
re

ss
 C

re
ek

, 
S

te
. 
2
0
0
-

3
1
0

C
ed

ar
 P

ar
k
, 
T

X
 7

8
6
1
3

S
af

et
y
 S

u
p
p
ly

, 
In

c.

1
1
8

2
7
 T

ec
h
 C

o
m

 R
d
.,
 #

1
1
4

S
an

 A
n
to

n
io

, 
T

X
 7

8
2
3
3

A
la

m
o
 D

is
tr

ib
u
ti

o
n
, 
L

L
C

 

A
la

m
o
 I

ro
n
 W

o
rk

s

9
4
3

 A
T

&
T

 C
en

te
r 

P
k
w

y

S
an

 A
n
to

n
io

, 
T

X
 7

8
2
1
9

M
S

C
 I

n
d
u
st

ri
al

 S
u
p
p
ly

1
2
1

 I
n
te

rp
ar

k
 B

lv
d
.,
 S

te
. 
1
2
0
3

S
an

 A
n
to

n
io

, 
T

X
 7

8
2
1
6

P
D

 M
o
rr

is
o
n
 E

n
te

rp
ri

se
s,

 I
n
c.

1
1
2

0
 T

o
ro

 G
ra

n
d
e 

D
r.

 B
ld

g
. 
2
, 

S
te

. 
2
0
8

C
ed

ar
 P

ar
k
, 
T

X
 7

8
6
1
3

G
en

u
in

e 
P

ar
ts

 C
o
.

6
3
7

4
 R

it
ti

m
an

 R
d
.

S
an

 A
n
to

n
io

, 
T

X
 7

8
2
1
8

 
 LIST PRICE 30.47 30.47 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

6. Plier Diagonal Cutters 6 IN Proto 206G, SAWS #14876 DISCOUNT 11.93 13.41
 
 LIST PRICE 29.85 29.85 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

7. Plier Long Nose 7 IN Proto 222G, SAWS #14879 DISCOUNT 10.68 13.13
 
  LIST PRICE 358.76 358.76 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

8. Socket Set 1/2 IN Deep 6PT 15 PC 3/8 thru 1 1/4 IN Proto J54103, SAWS #16053 DISCOUNT 140.86 157.85
 
 LIST PRICE 315.74 315.74 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

9. Socket Set 1/4 IN Drive 6PT 26 Piece Proto 47116, SAWS #16054 DISCOUNT 117.06 138.93
 
 LIST PRICE 222.98 222.98 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

10. Socket Set Std 1/2IN 12PNT 3/8 - 1 1/4 15 PCS Proto 54114, SAWS #16061 DISCOUNT 87.39 98.11
 
 LIST PRICE 24.35 24.35 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

11. Wrench Combo 9/16 IN 12 Point Proto 1218ASD, SAWS #17600 DISCOUNT 9.53 10.71
 
 LIST PRICE 21.59 21.59 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

12. Wrench Combo 1/2 IN 12 Point Proto J1216ASD, SAWS #17602 DISCOUNT 8.44 9.50
 
 LIST PRICE 601.08 601.08 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

13. Wrench Set COMB 12 PT/15 PC Proto 1200FASD, SAWS #17626 DISCOUNT 235.64 264.48
 Proto Price List 

*
Price List Catalog Number PR-2016 PR-010216

Discount Off Price List (%) 58% -56

Multiplier for Discount 0.42 .44

Effective Date of Price List 6-1-2015 Jan. 19, 2016
GROUP 12 GOLDBLATT (STANLEY) PRICE LIST (ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE $20,000)

 LIST PRICE 39.46 39.46 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
1. Frame Hacksaw Stanley 15-113, SAWS #12461 DISCOUNT 18.55 19.73

 
 LIST PRICE 17.48 17.48 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

2. Hammer Claw FG Curved 16 oz Stanley 51-621, SAWS #13027 DISCOUNT 6.78 8.74
 
 LIST PRICE 17.15 17.15 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

3. Screwdriver 12 IN Standard Stanley 66-162, SAWS #15736 DISCOUNT 6.84 8.58
 
 LIST PRICE 10.57 10.57 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

4. Screwdriver Std 6 IN Vinyl Grip Square Shaft Stanley 66-091, SAWS #15734 DISCOUNT 4.99 5.29
 
 LIST PRICE 13.16 13.16 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

5. Screwdriver Std 8 IN Vinyl Grip Square Shaft Stanley 66-092, SAWS #15735 DISCOUNT 5.26 6.58
 
 LIST PRICE 7.42 6.93 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

6. Knife Putty 1-1/4 IN Stanley ST28-541, SAWS #13389 DISCOUNT 3.63 3.47
  
 LIST PRICE 34.67 34.67 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

7. Tape Measure w/Lock 1IN x 25 FT Stanley 33-425, SAWS #16526 DISCOUNT 13.20 17.34

LIST PRICE 38.31 13.35 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
8. Level Torpedo Stanley 42-465, SAWS #13570 DISCOUNT 18.01 6.68

  
  LIST PRICE 11.08 11.08 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

9. Saw Hand 8 Point 26 IN Stanley 15-726, SAWS #15587 DISCOUNT 5.21 5.54
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 LIST PRICE 2.47 21.93 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

9. Blade Hacksaw 12 IN TPI 32 Stanley 15-614, SAWS #9668 DISCOUNT 1.14 10.97
 

LIST PRICE 8.91 8.91 NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
10. Screwdriver Set Jewelers 6 PC Stanley 66-039, SAWS #15729 DISCOUNT 4.19 4.46
 GOLDBLATT (STANLEY) PRICE LIST 

*
Price List Catalog Number PR-2016 SIT-010216

Discount Off Price List (%) 53% 50%

Multiplier for Discount 0.47 .50

Effective Date of Price List 6-1-2015 Jan. 2016
GROUP 13 RIDGID PRICE LIST (ESTIMATED USAGE $12,000)

 LIST PRICE 6.50 6.50 6.50 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
1. Cutter Wheel F158 0 RIDGID 33160 or E3469, SAWS #11342 DISCOUNT 4.59 5.72 5.62

LIST PRICE 64.25 64.25 64.25 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
2. Cutter Copper 5/8 x 2 1/8 RIDGID 32930, SAWS #11333 DISCOUNT 52.69 56.54 55.57

  
LIST PRICE 28.75 28.75 28.75 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

3. Cutter Copper Tube 1/8-1 - 1 1/8 IN RIGID 31622, SAWS #11331 DISCOUNT 23.61 25.30 24.87

LIST PRICE 22.35 22.35 22.35 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
4. Cutter Copper Tube 1/4 x 1 1/8 RIDGID 40617 Midget, SAWS #11332 DISCOUNT 18.33 19.67 19.33

LIST PRICE 268.55 214.15 268.55 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
5. Vise Chain Pipe Bench Yoke 1/8 IN - 2 1/2 IN RIGID 40085, SAWS #17393 DISCOUNT 224.30 188.45 232.30

LIST PRICE 24.00 24.00 24.00 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
6. Wrench Pipe 10 IN RIGID 31010HC, SAW #17615 DISCOUNT 18.88 21.12 20.76
 

 LIST PRICE 31.00 31.00 31.00 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
7. Wrench Pipe 14 IN RIGID Straight 31020-14, SAWS #17616 DISCOUNT 24.60 27.28 26.82

LIST PRICE 44.80 44.80 44.80 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
8. Wrench Pipe 18 IN RIGID Straight 31025-18, SAWS #17617 DISCOUNT 35.64 39.42 38.75

LIST PRICE 70.90 70.90 70.90 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
9 Wrench Pipe 24 IN RIGID 31030, SAWS #17618 DISCOUNT 56.46 62.39 61.33

LIST PRICE 18.30 18.30 18.30 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
10. Wrench Pipe 8  IN RIGID 31005HC, SAWS #17620 DISCOUNT 14.30 16.10 15.83
 RIDGID PRICE LIST

*
Price List Catalog Number Ridgid 315-D 316 315

13.5%
Discount Off Price List (%) 14% 12%

Multiplier for Discount 0.86 .88 .865

Effective Date of Price List 3-1-15 Jan. 2016 March 30, 2015
GROUP 14 KLEIN PRICE LIST (ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE $10,000)

 LIST PRICE 41.57 60.22 65.87 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
1. Drill Bit Step 9 in Klein 59003, SAWS #11510 DISCOUNT 29.10 45.16 48.09

LIST PRICE 36.10 33.50 36.67 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
2. Knife Slitting Elect 2-5/8 in Klein 1550 4 Curved Blade, SAWS #13391 DISCOUNT 19.10 25.13 26.77

7



F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 15-0401

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
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TIME & (January 1, 2016 through December 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 19, 2016
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LIST PRICE 41.00 17.00 19.78 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
3. Knife Utility with Hoster 6 IN Klein 44107-3, Blade 11-921, SAWS #13392 DISCOUNT 28.70 12.75 14.44

LIST PRICE 37.34 34.94 96.47 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
4. Plier Diag Heavy Duty 8 IN, SAWS #14875 DISCOUNT 20.79 26.21 70.42

LIST PRICE 38.26 37.24 83.24 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
5. Plier LG Nose Heavy Duty 8 5/16 IN KL5415L, SAWS #14877 DISCOUNT 26.78 27.93 60.77
 

LIST PRICE 122.20 113.36 126.00 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
6. Plier Multi Tool Trip Saver 1016/74416-7 DISCOUNT 67.78 85.02 91.98

LIST PRICE 48.64 44.50 45.90 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
7. Plier Side Cut Hgh LVRG 9 IN Klein KLD213 9 NE, SAWS #14882 DISCOUNT 27.11 33.38 33.51

LIST PRICE 62.42 60.74 64.37 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
8. Plier Lineman Cutters Klein HD2000PNE/Proto J268G, SAWS #14883 DISCOUNT 34.74 45.56 46.99

LIST PRICE 50.53 31.00 34.93 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
9. Plier Slip-Joint 10 IN Klein 73210-2, SAWS #14884 DISCOUNT 14.03 23.25 25.50

LIST PRICE 15.46 15.04 16.97 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
10. Screwdriver Slot 6 IN Screwhold Klein K46 Screw Holding, SAWS #15733 DISCOUNT 8.59 11.28 12.39

 
LIST PRICE 27.92 26.16 29.74 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

11. Tape Measure Power-Return Magnetic TIP-916 25RE, SAW #16513 DISCOUNT 16.04 19.62 21.71
 KLEIN PRICE LIST

Price List Catalog Number USA Price List 2016 Klein 2016

Discount Off Price List (%) 30% 25% 27%

Multiplier for Discount 0.70 .75 .73

Effective Date of Price List 1-1-2016 Jan. 2016 1-1-2016
GROUP 15 COOPER PRICE LIST (ESTIMATED USAGE $10,000)

 LIST PRICE 29.98 29.98 29.98 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE
1. Wrench Adjustable 6 IN Crescent AC 16, SAWS #17574 DISCOUNT 16.80 17.99 16.79

LIST PRICE 31.43 31.43 31.43 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE
2. Wrench Adjustable 8 IN Crescent AC 18, SAWS #17575 DISCOUNT 15.96 18.85 17.60

LIST PRICE 40.75 40.75 40.75 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE
3. Wrench Adjustable 10 IN Crescent AC 110, SAWS #17570 DISCOUNT 21.59 24.45 22.82

LIST PRICE 58.84 58.84 58.84 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE
4. Wrench Adjustable 12 IN Crescent AC112, SAWS #17571 DISCOUNT 31.14 35.30 32.95

LIST PRICE 94.98 94.98 94.98 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE
5. Wrench Adjustable 15 IN Crescent AC115, SAWS #17572 DISCOUNT 50.01 56.99 53.19

LIST PRICE 268.00 257.88 268.00 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE
6. Wrench Adjustable 24 IN Crescent AC124, SAWS #17573 DISCOUNT 155.44 154.73 150.08
 COOPER PRICE LIST

*
Price List Catalog Number AP-2015 CHT-02516 2016

Discount Off Price List (%) 42% 40% 44%

Multiplier for Discount 0.58 .60 .56

Effective Date of Price List 3-1-15 Jan. 2016 January 2016
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GROUP 16 REED PRICE LIST (Estimated Usage $12,000)
 LIST PRICE 21.77 NO BID NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

1. Cutter Wheel Univ 6IN-12IN Reed PT H6PSE5, SAWS #11347 DISCOUNT 19.16

LIST PRICE 93.06 NO BID NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
2. Cutter Plastic Reed PT TC2Q-P, SAWS #11336 DISCOUNT 81.89

LIST PRICE 137.39 NO BID NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
3. Scraper Pipe Descaler 3 IN - 12 IN Reed DS12, SAWS #15608 DISCOUNT 120.90

LIST PRICE 146.11 NO BID NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
4. Wrench Ratchet 1-1/4 IN One Each L50/L20, SAWS #17626 DISCOUNT 128.58

LIST PRICE 146.11 NO BID NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
5. Wrench Ratchet 1-1/16 IN One Each L50/L 17, SAWS #17622 DISCOUNT 128.58

LIST PRICE 603.00 NO BID NO BID INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
6. Kit, Extension, Size 12", Used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, SAWS #13325 DISCOUNT 713.75
 REED PRICE LIST

*
Price List Catalog Number Reed 2015

Discount Off Price List (%) 12%

Multiplier for Discount 0.88

Effective Date of Price List 2-15-15
GROUP 17 ARMSTRONG PRICE LIST (ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE $20,000)

 LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 31.22 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
1. Frame Hacksaw, Stanley 15-113, SAWS #12461 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 17.48

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 25.54 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
2. Hammer Claw FG Curved 16 oz, Stanley 51-621, SAWS #13027 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 14.30

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 15.79 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
3. Screwdriver 12 IN Standard Stanley 66-162, SAWS #15736 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 8.84

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 13.51 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
4. Screwdriver Std 6 IN Vinyl Grip Square Shaft Stanley 66-091, SAWS #15734 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 7.57

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 20.51 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
5. Screwdriver Std 8 IN Vinyl Grip Square Shaft Stanley 66-092, SAWS #15735 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 11.49

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 15.58 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
6. Knife Putty 1-1/4 IN Stanley ST28-541, SAWS #13389 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 8.72

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 25.00 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
7. Tape Measure w/Lock 1 IN x 25 FT Stanley 33-425, SAWS #16526 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 14.00

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 9.00 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
8. Level Torpedo Stanley 42-465, SAWS #13570 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 5.04

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 23.00 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
9. Saw Hand 8 Point 26 IN Stanley 15-726, SAWS #15587 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 12.88

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 21.11 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
10. Blade Hacksaw 12 IN TPI 32 Stanley 15-614, SAWS #9668 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 1.18

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 34.09 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
11. Screwdriver Set Jewelers 6 PC Stanley 66-039, SAWS #15729 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 19.09
 ARMSTRONG PRICE LIST

Price List Catalog Number 2016

Discount Off Price List (%) 44%
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Multiplier for Discount .56

Effective Date of Price List January 2016
GROUP 18 GEARWRENCH PRICE LIST (ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE $45,000)

 LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 14.68 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
1. Chisel Cold 3/4 IN Proto 86A-5/8, SAWS #10344 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 8.22

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 61.70 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
2. Handle Hnge 18-5/8 x 1/2 IN DR Proto 5468, SAWS #13045 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 34.55

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 109.51 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
3. Punch Drift Set 7 Piece Proto 96A, SAWS #15072 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 61.33

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 63.14 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
4. Rachet Drive 1/2 IN Proto 5449, SAWS #15089 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 35.36

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 121.06 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
5. Screw/DR Set Combo 8 Piece Proto 88808, SAWS #15728 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 67.79

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 32.70 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
6. Plier Diagonal Cutters 6 IN Proto 206G, SAWS #14876 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 18.31

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 25.88 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
7. Plier Long Nose 7 IN Proto 222G, SAWS #14879 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 14.49

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 368.91 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
8. Socket Set 1/2 IN Deep 6 PT 15 PC 3/8 Thru 1 1/4 IN Proto J54103, SAWS #16053 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 206.59

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 338.58 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
9. Socket Set 1/4 IN Drive 6 PT 26 Piece Proto 47116, SAWS #16054 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 189.60

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 241.67 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
10. Socket Set Std 1/2 IN 12 PNT 3/8 - 1 1/4 15 PCS Proto 54114, SAWS #16061 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 135.33

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 26.18 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
11. Wrench Combo 9/16 IN 12 Point Proto 1218ASD, SAWS #17600 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 14.66

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 23.07 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
12. Wrench Combo 1/2 12 PT Proto J1216ASD, SAWS #17602 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 12.92

LIST PRICE NOT BIDDING NOT BIDDING 639.39 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
12. Wrench Set Comb 12 PT/15 PC Proto 1200FASD, SAWS #17626 DISCOUNT MFG. CATALOG MFG. CATALOG 358.06
 GEARWRENCH PRICE LIST

Price List Catalog Number 2016

Discount Off Price List (%) 44%

Multiplier for Discount .56

Effective Date of Price List January 2016

EXTENSION 1 104,282.50 1,967.70 82,554.50 793.75

EXTESNION 2 104,282.50 1,967.70 82,554.50 793.75

EXTESNION 3 104,282.50 1,967.70 82,554.50 793.75
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Net Net 2% Net 2%
Terms 30 days 30 days 10 days 30 days 10 days

Delivery Days 3-5 days 2-7 days 2-3 days 2-3 days

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
 
Alamo Distribution Mapa Distributors Demandstar
Bay Tincorp MSC Industrial Supply SAWS Website

 Bullchase Inc. PD Morrison Enterprises Inc.
Fastenal Royall Matthiessen
Genuine Parts Co. Safety Supply, Inc.
Grainger Tool Mart Inc.

HD Supply White Cap
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